TRADEMARK ASSIGNMENT

Electronic Version v1.1

Stylesheet Version v

1.1

SUBMISSION TYPE:

NEW ASSIGNMENT

NATURE OF CONVEYANCE:

CHANGE OF NAME

CONVEYING PARTY DATA

| Name

|| Formerly

|| Execution Date ||

Entity Type

|Thermo Electron Corporation || ||1 1/09/2006

[CORPORATION: DELAWARE |

RECEIVING PARTY DATA

|Name: ||Thermo Fisher Scientific Inc. |
|Street Address: ||81 Wyman Street |
lcity: |l waltham |
|State/Country: |IMASSACHUSETTS |
|Postal Code: 02454 |
[Entity Type: ICORPORATION: DELAWARE |

PROPERTY NUMBERS Total: 1

Phone:

Email:

Correspondent Name:
Address Line 1:
Address Line 4:

Property Type Number Word Mark
Serial Number: 78830075 RADREACHBACK
CORRESPONDENCE DATA
Fax Number: (312)803-2209

Correspondence will be sent via US Mail when the fax attempft is unsuccessful.

312-464-3100
aocasio@loeb.com

Douglas N. Masters

321 N. Clark St., Suite 2300
Chicago, ILLINOIS 60610

ATTORNEY DOCKET

NUMBER: 400799-10008

NAME OF SUBMITTER:

Douglas N. Masters

Signature:

/Douglas N. Masters/

Date:

04/03/2008

900103301

REEL: 003752 FRAME: 0298

TRADEMARK

$40.00




Total Attachments: 3

source=Change of Name#page1.tif
source=Change of Name#page2.tif
source=Change of Name#page3.tif

TRADEMARK
REEL: 003752 FRAME: 0299




Debwag ...

The Firs$ tate

I, HARR I ET SMINTHOWR STEARREOF SF NTHE B TOAFT
D E 1A W, ARBO HE RE ERYT CEY T HECAE I I SUEAANDRC O RRE C
COPY BEFCIERTIEFACE MMEND MEF T HRERMOE'C T R O N
CORPORNT ICHAN G IINIGS N AME FR KE RMO CETIREO N
CORPORNTT®''THFRMOS HERNSTEEC INGILED SN THI
OFF I CEHD W INT HODFANO VEMBE RD . ,2 0r0%2 A2 0 'C L O
P. M.

A FILEDPYCOF WHRITSI FHASATEENABD BN T O T HE
NEW CASTIUNIr'Y RECORIFEREED S

Lt Lots Bhe

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0558016 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 5183450

DATE: 11-09-06
TRADEMARK

REEL: 003752 FRAME: 0300

061028313



State of Delaware
Secretary of State
Division of Corporations
Delivered 12:12 PM 11/09/2006
FILED 12:29 PM 11/09/2006
SRV 061028313 ~ 0558016 FILE

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF
THIRD AMENDED AND RESTATED CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION
OF
THERMO ELECTRON CORPORATION

Thermo Electron Corporation, a corporation organized and existing under and by
virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State of Delaware (the “Company”),

DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That by an action by the Board of Directors dated July 13, 2006, resolu-
tions were duly adopted setting forth proposed amendments of the Third Amended and Restated
Certificate of Incorporation of the Company. The resolutions setting forth the proposed amend-
ments are as follows:

RESOLVED, that, following approval of the stockholders of the
Company, and effective upon the Effective Time (as such term is defined in the
Agreement and Plan of Merger, dated May 7, 2006, by and among the Company,
Fisher Scientific International Inc. and Trumpet Merger Corporation), Article
FIRST to the Company’s Third Amended and Restated Certificate of Incorpora-
tion shall be amended to read in its entirety as follows: “FIRST: The name of the
Company is Thermo Fisher Scientific Inc.”

RESOLVED, that, upon approval of the stockholders of the Com-
pany, the first paragraph of Article FOURTH to the Company’s Third Amended
and Restated Certificate of Incorporation shall be amended by deleting the words
“Three Hundred Fifty Million (350,000,000)” in the first sentence thereof and in-
serting in its place the words “One Billion Two Hundred Million
(1,200,000,000)".

SECOND: That at a meeting and vote of stockholders dated August 30, 2006,
said amendments were duly adopted in accordance with the applicable provisions of Section 242
of the General Corporation Law of the State of Delaware.

THIRD: That Article FIRST to the Company’s Third Amended and Restated
Certificate of Incorporation be, and it hereby is, amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“FIRST: The name of the Company is Thermo Fisher Scientific Inc.”

FOURTH: That the first paragraph of Article FOURTH to the Company’s Third
Amended and Restated Certificate of Incorporation be, and it hereby is, amended by deleting the
words “Three Hundred Fifty Million (350,000,000)" in the first sentence thereof and inserting in
its place the words “One Billion Two Hundred Million (1,200,000,000)”.

TRADEMARK
REEL: 003752 FRAME: 0301



FIFTH: That the amendments of the Company’s Third Amended and Restated
Certificate of Incorporation herein certified have been duly adopted in accordance with the pro-
visions of Section 242 of the General Corporation Law of the State of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said Thermo Electron Corporation has caused this
certificate to be signed by its President and Chief Executive Officer, and attested by its Vice
President, General Counsel and Secretary, this 9 day of November, 2006.

oIV etistiors

Name: Marijn E. Dekkers
Title: President and Chief Executive Officer

ATTEST:

Name: Seth H. Hoogasian |
Title: Vice President, General Counsel and Secretary

TRADEMARK
RECORDED: 04/03/2008 REEL: 003752 FRAME: 0302



